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Shreshtha Bhagat <shreshtha.bhagat@gmail.com>

Re: Lab Exam Fees Payment: MIT2022C00252
1 message

Harshada Lokhande <studentcare15@mitsde.com> Thu, Feb 22, 2024 at 4:34 PM
To: Shreshtha Bhagat <shreshtha.bhagat@gmail.com>

Dear Student,

Greetings of the Day!!

Payment received and updated.

For further queries, please raise a callback request or generate a ticket from the E-library portal.

shorturl.at/djvCD  If you like our assistance, please leave a Google review!!

Regards,
Harshada Lokhande
Course Relationship Manager

On Thu, Feb 22, 2024 at 4:23 PM Shreshtha Bhagat <shreshtha.bhagat@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear madam,

As per our discussion, the remaining fees for the Oracal Primavera subject have been successfully made from my
end.

Shreshtha Kumar

On Thu, Feb 22, 2024 at 4:16 PM Harshada Lokhande <studentcare15@mitsde.com> wrote:
Dear Student,

Greetings of the Day!!

As discussed, please refer to the below payment link for the exam.

Link: https://mitsde.com/OtherFeesPaymenticici (500 per subject)
Amount: 500/-

Hope this helps you.

For further queries, please raise a callback request or generate a ticket from the E-library portal.

shorturl.at/djvCD  If you like our assistance, please leave a Google review!!

Regards,
Harshada Lokhande
Course Relationship Manager

https://elibrary.mitsde.com/callmeback.php
https://elibrary.mitsde.com/
https://elibrary.mitsde.com/
http://shorturl.at/djvCD
mailto:shreshtha.bhagat@gmail.com
mailto:studentcare15@mitsde.com
https://mitsde.com/OtherFeesPaymenticici
https://mitsde.com/OtherFeesPaymenticici
https://elibrary.mitsde.com/callmeback.php
https://elibrary.mitsde.com/
https://elibrary.mitsde.com/
http://shorturl.at/djvCD

