
Atul Sawant <studentcare14@mitsde.com>

Fees Payment Link - MIT2022D02436
Sujata Patel <sujata@relicbiotech.com> Sat, May 25, 2024 at 8:16 PM
To: Atul Sawant <studentcare14@mitsde.com>

Logistics and supply chain management 

On Fri, 24 May 2024, 14:50 Atul Sawant, <studentcare14@mitsde.com> wrote:
Dear Sujata,

We are trying to reach you on your number  , however it is ringing , no answer.

We have received your fees payment and the same has been updated in our system.

Please share the new specialization name .

Regards,
Atul Sawant
Course Relationship Manager

 

On Thu, May 23, 2024 at 12:24 PM Sujata Patel <sujata@relicbiotech.com> wrote:
dear sir, payment done for change in specialization.

On Wed, May 22, 2024 at 2:43 PM Atul Sawant <studentcare14@mitsde.com> wrote:
Dear Student,

Greetings for the day,

As we discussed Please refer below link for an online fees submission :

http://www.mitsde.com/OtherFeesPaymentHDFC

Fees Type : Change of Specialization ( Rs.3000)

Regards,
Atul Sawant
Course Relationship Manager
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